F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

12-0036

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM .S .
P. 0. BOX 2449 2 g J 0 o
SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449 >3 x 0 % g Q 3 o - 2
TABULATION OF BIDS § =) S g ) = R - m § % < % <
- £Ss SEx g2 % =%z -
PROPOSAL ng B%; ;go- Bagcz) o3 OOI\
FOR: Annual Contract for Water Meters TSk g o g >3 2 % L5 LEJ g < = § X
nvee  (January 1, 2013 through May 31, 2014) e sz 3 g3 2 - <z S3
oate 3:00 p.m., November 29, 2013 232 So = » g < = g O = so 5
c83 SRZ 05 & S80¢@ z29% 525
ITEM NO.  DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY N o < mn < = T aw = S0 O w - O <o v
*
50,000 ea. SAWS #13739 UNIT 43.00 43.00 43.95 62.35
5/8" x 3/4" Displacement Meter PRICE 2,150,000.00 2,150,000.00 2,197,500.00 3,117,500.00
1. Make and Model quoting TOTAL Nitro 11 PNPD02 Recordall LP Low Lead w/register Neptune T-10 Hersey Model 430
2,500 ea. SAWS #13738 UNIT 72.00 65.90 95.40
3/4" Displacement Meter PRICE NOT APPROVED 180,000.00 164,750.00 238,500.00
2. Make and Model quoting TOTAL Recordall 35 Low Lead w/register Neptune T-10 Hersey Model 442
1,400 ea. SAWS #13737 UNIT 105.00 103.20 124.04
1" Displacement meter PRICE NOT APPROVED 147,000.00 144,480.00 173,656.00
3. Make and Model quoting TOTAL Recordall M55 Low Lead wiregister Neptune T-10 Hersey Model 452
600 ea. SAWS #13736 UNIT 269.00 264.90 302.80
1-1/2" Displacement Meter PRICE NOT APPROVED 161,400.00 158,940.00 181,680.00
4, Make and Model quoting TOTAL Recordall M120 Low Lead w/register Neptune HP Turbine Hersey Model 562 E A
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1,500 ea. SAWS #13741 UNIT 369.00 432.95 401.54 ';: > ';: 50
2" Turbo-Type Meter PRICE NO BID 553,500.00 649,425.00 602,310.00 5 8 5 8 g
5. Make and Model quoting TOTAL Recordall Turbo 200 Low Lead w/register Neptune HP Turbine Hersey Model MVR 160 ?‘% E.ﬂ) 2(3 2 |<E
* - F@do
75 ea. SAWS #13742 UNIT 550.00 615.10 745.36 ('3 ﬁ 5 Q i
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6. Make and Model quoting TOTAL Recordall Turbo 450 Low Lead w/register Neptune HP Turbine Hersey Model MVR 350 o o 8 UEJ
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50 ea. SAWS #13768 UNIT 736.00 720.00 1,041.09
4" Tubro-Type Meter PRICE NO BID 36,800.00 36,000.00 52,054.50
7. Make and Model quoting TOTAL Recordall Turbo 1000 Low Lead w/register Neptune HP Turbine Hersey Model MVR 650
25 ea. SAWS #13744 UNIT 1,799.00 1,320.00 2,136.24
6" Turbo-Type Meter PRICE NO BID 44,975.00 33,000.00 53,406.00
8. Make and Model quoting TOTAL Recordall Turbo 2000 Low Lead w/register Neptune HP Turbine Hersey Model 1300
15 ea. SAWS #13745 UNIT 2,020.00 1,975.00
8" Turbo-Type Meter PRICE NO BID 30,300.00 29,625.00 NO BID
9. Make and Model quoting TOTAL Recordall Turbo 3500 Low Lead w/register Neptune HP Turbine
4 ea. SAWS #13740 UNIT 2,778.00 2,825.00
10" Turbo-Type Meter PRICE NO BID 11,112.00 11,300.00 NO BID
10. Make and Model quoting TOTAL Recordall Turbo 5500 Low Lead w/register Neptune HP Turbine
TOTAL 2,150,000.00 605,862.00 566,795.00
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EXTENSION 1 2,150,000.00 605,862.00 566,795.00
EXTENSION 2 2,150,000.00 605,862.00 566,795.00
EXTENSION 3 2,150,000.00 605,862.00 566,795.00
1.5% Net Net 2%
Terms 10 days 30 days 30 days 30 days
Delivery 20-45 days 30 days 35-40 days
*LOW BIDDER
BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:
Act Pipe and Supply, Inc. Master Meter Demandstar
Agua Metric Sales Co. Morrison Supply SAWS Website

Badger Meter, Inc.
Elster AMCO Water, Inc.

Hersey Meters Co.

Mueller Systems, LLC
Municipal Water Works Supply
Ferguson Neptune Technology

HD Supply Performance Meter, Inc.
Zenner Performance Meters




